CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER: 004-16 1/5/2016
BWI DALLAS/FT WORTH Harrell's LLC
Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price | Bidder's Product Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price | Bidder's Product
FUNGICIDES
1]Eagle 20ew 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 182.95 same 10 gal. 1 gal. $  209.16 same
2]Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $  190.00 same 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $  190.00 same
3|Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. $  509.00 same 6 gal. 1 gal. $  509.00 same
HERBICIDES
1]Sedge Hammer 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles | $ 60.46 same 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles | $ 62.98 ProSedge 2
2]Primo Link Pak 20 gal. 10 gal. $ 2,740.00 | Primo Mark Agency J20 gal. 10 gal. $ 2,740.00 same
3|Revolver® 30 gts. 1qt. $ 201.85 same 30 gts. 1qt. $ 23573 same
4]Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. $ 143.00 same 50 gal. 1 gal. $ 143.00 same
5]Monument 1500 grams |25 gram box $  242.50 | Monument Agency J1500 grams |25 gram box $  242.50 same
6]Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum $ 520.88 90 gal. 30 gal. drum $ 395.00 Glystar Pro
7]Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 525.00 same 50 gal. 2.5gal. $ 578.75 same
8|Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5gal. $ 101.25 same 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 135.78 same
9|Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. 2.5gal. $ 63.15 same 100 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 88.28 same
10]Specticle Flo* 15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,400.00 same 15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,575.00 same
*Special price for 14 or more Gal. on one invoice if less price is "Price for 870z is $550.80
$1575.00/1gal MPrice for 10 gal. is $1247.50
“APrice for 250gm is 217.50
*Price for 14gal is $1400.00
INSECTICIDES
1]Provant* 20 100z. Btls |10 oz. bottle $ 68.23 same 20 100z. Btls |10 oz. bottle $ 90.00 same
2]Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $ 12425 Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $  143.58 same
3JAdvion Fire Ant** 36# 12# bag $ 110.078 Advion #25 36# 12# bag $ 27733 Advion #25
4|Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag $ 23761 Award Il 50# 25# bag $  260.00 Award Il
*Provant is now packaging in 120z containents. Price shown is for
100z. Price for 120z is $81.87
**The 12Ib bag of Advion has been discontinued by the
manufacturer. The price shown is for 12lbs. The price for 25Ib bag
is $229.33
OTHER
1]K-Mag 10 ton 50Ib. $ 15.50 same 10 ton 50Ib. $ 21.65 same
2] TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal. No Bid No Bid 165 gal. 55 gal. $ 1,420.00 | HydroCure 30gal
12-0-0 w/ 6%--100% Chealated 12-0-0 6% Fe, 3%
3}iron +.5% Mn 500 gal. 2.5ga $ 9.9743 | Growth Products J500 gal. 2.5ga $ 40.00 Mn
12-0-0 6% Fe, 3%
30 gal $  299.23 Iron Max 30 gal $  440.00 Mn
*Price for 275 gal is $3550.00

1/5/2016 10:48 AM

Loryn English, Purchasing Technician



CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

BID NUMBER: 004-16 1/5/2016
Helena Chemical Company SiteOne Landscape Supply
Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price | Bidder's Product Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price | Bidder's Product
FUNGICIDES
1|Eagle 20ew 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 192.55 same 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 217.76 0025639
47068 Daconil
2]Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 76.00 same 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $  190.00 Action Agency
21327 Heritage TL
3|Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. $  509.00 same 6 gal. 1 gal. $ 509.00 Agency
HERBICIDES
1]Sedge Hammer 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles | $ 76.00 same 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles | $ 65.82 35720
22535 Primo Link
2]Primo Link Pak 20 gal. 10 gal. $ 2,740.00 Pimo Mark 20 gal. 10 gal. $ 2,740.00 Pak Agency
3|Revolver 30 qgts. 1 qt. $ 213.74 same 30 gts. 1qt. $ 247.03 79850980
Q.P. Prodiamme 37150 Barricade 4L
4]Barricade 4L 50 gal. 2.5gal. $ 69.85 7L 50 gal. 1 gal. $ 143.00 Agency
Monument 250 19560 Monument
5IMonument 1500 grams |25 gram box $ 217.50 gram + price 1500 grams |25 gram box $ 242.50 Agency
6|Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum $ 12.50 Ranger Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum $ 614.55 097971
7]Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $  465.45 same 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 640.66 00278317
8|Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5gal. $ 129.25 same 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 127.46 701191
59015210
9]Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 70.70 | Pendelum 3.3Ec ]100 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 75.84 PRC.M3.3EC
80526318 Specticle
10]Specticle Flo 15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,575.00 same 15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,575.00 Elo Aaency
INSECTICIDES
1]Provant 20 100z. Btls |120 oz. bottle | $  810.00 same 20 100z. Btls |12 oz bottle $ 96.97 53344
2]Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $ 141.19 Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $  154.00 | 73419 Scimitar GC
3]Advion Fire Ant 36# 12# bag $ 262.50 Advion #25 36# 12# bag $ 185.10 57204
4]Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag $ 258.50 Award Il 50# 25# bag $  349.24 | 53209 Advion Fire
OTHER
1]K-Mag 10 ton 50Ib. $ 14.50 same 10 ton 50Ib. $ 16.91 BG002250
2| TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 95.00 Soaker Plus 165 gal. 55 gal. No Bid
12-0-0 w/ 6%--100% Chealated Turf Nector 15
3|iron +.5% Mn 500 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 8.00 0-0 6% Fe 500 gal. 55 gal. $ 6.57 084042
4 30 gal.

CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION
1/5/2016 10:48 AM "ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR BERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS" Loryn English, Purchasing Technician



BID NUMBER: 004-16

1/5/2016

Turf Care of Texas Winfield
Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price | Bidder's Product Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price | Bidder's Product
FUNGICIDES
1]Eagle 20ew 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 125.00 MyelOOEW 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 202.00 same
2]Daconil Action 15 gal. 2.5 gal. No Bid 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 190.00 same
3|Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. $ 625.00 Azoxy 25C 6 gal. 1 gal. $ 509.00 same
HERBICIDES
1]Sedge Hammer 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles | $ 87.50 same 30 bottles 1.3 oz. bottles | $ 69.32 ProSedge 2
2|Primo Link Pak 20 gal. 10 gal. No Bid 20 gal. 10 gal. $ 2,740.00 same
3|Revolver 30 gts. 1qt. No Bid 30 gts. 1qt. $ 21751 same
4|Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. $ 87.50 Prodiamne 4L |50 gal. 1 gal. $ 143.00 same
5IMonument 1500 grams |25 gram box No Bid 1500 grams |25 gram box $ 217.50 same
6|Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum $  450.00 Glystar Plus 90 gal. 30 gal. drum $ 610.80 same
7|Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5gal. $ 528.00 Dithiopyr 2L 50 gal. 2.5gal. $ 578.75 same
8|Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 125.00 Oryzalin 4 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 108.88 same
9|Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 106.25 | Pendulum 3.3EC ]100 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 93.70 | Up End Hydrocap
10]Specticle Flo 15 gal. 1 gal. No Bid 15 gal. 1 gal. $ 1,575.00 same
INSECTICIDES
1]Provant 20 100z. Btls |10 oz. bottle No Bid 20 100z. Btls |12 oz. bottle $ 103.92 same
2|Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $ 17.18 Lambda Select |8 quarts Qt. $ 14271 same
3|Advion Fire Ant 36# 124# bag No Bid 36# 12# bag $ 14791 same
4|Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag No Bid 50# 25# bag $ 263.25 same
OTHER
1]K-Mag 10 ton 50Ib. No Bid 10 ton 50Ib. $ 20.25 same
2| TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal. $ 3,850.00 Retan Pro 165 gal. 55 gal. $ 3,874.20 same
12-0-0 w/ 6%--100% Chealated
3|iron +.5% Mn 500 gal. 2.5 gal. No Bid 500 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 9.85 | Gravity L 12-0-0
3

1/5/2016 10:48 AM

Loryn English, Purchasing Technician
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