CC MEETING: MARCH 19, 2013

DATE: MARCH 11, 2013
TO: Leonard Martin, City Manager
FROM: Vince Priolo, Purchasing Manager

SUBJECT: Consider Approval Of Bid #13-011 For Public Works From Various Vendors
In An Amount To Not Exceed $648,900.00.

BACKGROUND: The material to be purchased from this price agreement will provide concrete for
street projects and miscellaneous repair jobs throughout the City. This price agreement contains the
option to renew for one additional year if mutually agreed upon by both parties.

Bids were advertised and received from vendors in which two responded and two provided a “No
Bid”. Low-than-normal bid participation is because the concrete market has become very
competitive due to the upswing in the economy, and this was discussed with Public Works.

FINANCIAL IMPLICATIONS: The materials on Bid # 13-011 will be purchased from budgeted
funds for the cost centers and amounts as listed below:

COST CENTER LINE ITEM BUDGET AMOUNT
STREETS - 402001 60310 - CONCRETE $ 450,000.00
STREETS - 403001 60310 - CONCRETE $ 3,000.00
TRAFFIC SIGNALS - VARIOUS CAP ACCOUNTS $ 2,000.00
WATER - 405005 60310 - CONCRETE $ 102,000.00
WATER - 405002 60310 - CONCRETE $ 52,500.00
WATER - 405003 60310 - CONCRETE $ 35,000.00
PARKS - 353002 60310 - CONCRETE $ 4,400.00
TOTAL $ 648,900.00

STAFF RECOMMENDATION/ACTION DESIRED: Staff recommends that the best value bid
meeting all specifications be awarded as listed below for an amount not to exceed $648,900.00.

COMPANY NAME CATEGORY
Redi-Mix Primary Vendor All Items
Lattimore Materials Secondary Vendor All Items

NOTE: Multiple vendor awards are needed due to a periodic supply problem with this commodity.
Also due to past vendor issues, should the city experience a problem regarding delivery from Redi-
Mix, Lattimore will be available as a secondary vendor.

NOTE: Items 11 & 12 will be purchased on the open market, since NO BIDS were received by both
vendors.

ATTACHEMENT: TAB SHEET



Bid #13-011 CONCRETE

charge for any
loads that contain
less than 5 yards

PRICE PER
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION YARD
READY MIX
CONCRETE . -
(3,000 PSI) Lattimore Redi-Mix
1 300 CU YD PICK UP $77.00 $ 71.50
2 300 CU YD DELIVERED $85.00 $ 82.50
READY MIX
CONCRETE
(3,500 PSI)
3 100 CU YD PICK UP $79.50 $ 73.50
4 100 CU YD DELIVERED $87.50 $ 84.50
READY MIX CONCRETE (4,000 PSI)
5 1800 CU YD PICK UP $82.00 $ 75.50
6 4500 CU YD DELIVERED $90.00 $ 86.50
READY MIX CONCRETE (4,500 PSI)
7 100 CU YD PICK UP $84.50 $ 77.50
8 100 CU YD DELIVERED $92.50 $ 88.50
READY MIX CONCRETE (5,000 PSI)
9 500 CU YD PICK UP $87.00 $ 79.50
10 500 CU YD DELIVERED $95.00 $ 90.50
QUICK
FORMING
CONCRETE -
DELIVERED
QUICK  SET -
11 306 CU YD 6 HOUR $0.00 NO BID
QUICK  SET -
12 150 CU YD 12 HOUR $0.00 NO BID
Additional Price per cubic yard
Fiber mesh 650 or “approved equivalent”
13 | macro-synthetic 5.00 per Ib 16.50 @ 3LB PER CYD
fiber reinforced concrete
Distance from plant to intersection of PGBT - 190 and Josey Lane in
Carrollton, Texas 10 miles 10 miles
Normal
Delivery Time: 1 hour 18 min
Does your company allow any sort of discount for prompt payment;
if so please list details/payment NO NO
100.00 per truck

no bid

Nelson No Bid

TXI No Bid

Secondary Vendor

Primary Vendor




