
Bid #11-26-A Clamps Fittings and Pipe
Lot: Clamps Smith-Blair or Approved Equal

Morrison Supply Hughes Supply Inc. Metro Valve  Pipe
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--01-01 2"x3" Repair Clamp 8 each $23.39 $187.12 romac M230030238 $10.15 $81.20 Mueller $6.56 $52.48 FORD $4.44 $35.52 245-023803-000 Smith Blair FSC-238-3R $12.41 $99.28 FORD $23.00 $184.00 romac
11-26-A--01-02 2"x7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp 8 each $27.09 $216.72 romac M500070235 $24.69 $197.52 2.35-2.63 Mueller $29.00 $232.00 FORD $25.69 $205.52 226-023807-000 Smith Blair F1-263-75 $29.60 $236.80 FORD $26.17 $209.36 romac
11-26-A--01-03 4"x7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp 8 each $35.49 $283.92 romac M500070445 $32.50 $260.00 4.45-4.87 Mueller $33.95 $271.60 FORD $32.02 $256.16 226-048007-000 Smith Blair F1-514-75 $33.65 $269.20 FORD $34.28 $274.24 romac
11-26-A--01-04 4"x12-1/2" Full Circle Clamp 4 each $59.83 $239.32 romac M50012445 $50.17 $200.68 4.45-4.87 Mueller $50.40 $201.60 FORD $52.48 $209.92 226-048012-000 Smith Blair F1-514-125 $52.75 $211.00 FORD $57.80 $231.20 romac
11-26-A--01-05 6"x7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp 20 each $41.89 $837.80 romac M500070655 $35.56 $711.20 6X7-1/2 FC REP CLMP 6.55-6.97 O.D. RANGE Mueller $36.30 $726.00 FORD $37.79 $755.80 226-069007-000 Smith Blair F1-724-75 $37.55 $751.00 FORD $40.47 $809.40 romac
11-26-A--01-06 6"x 12-1/2" Full Circle Clamp 20 each $66.99 $1,339.80 romac M500120655 $56.87 $1,137.40 6X12 FC REP CLMP 6.55-6.97 O.D. RANGE Mueller $58.10 $1,162.00 FORD $60.45 $1,209.00 226-069012-000 Smith Blair F1-724-125 $60.10 $1,202.00 FORD $64.72 $1,294.40 romac
11-26-A--01-07 6"x15" Full Circle Clamp 8 each $79.77 $638.16 romac M500150655 $65.43 $523.44 6X15 FC REP CLMP 6.55-6.97 O.D. RANGE Mueller $67.45 $539.60 FORD $70.25 $562.00 226-069015-000 Smith Blair F1-724-15 $68.30 $546.40 FORD $77.06 $616.48 romac
11-26-A--01-08 6"x20" Full Circle Clamp 6 each $112.80 $676.80 romac M500200655 $117.58 $705.48 6X20 FC REP CLMP 6.55-6.97 O.D. RANGE Mueller $90.25 $541.50 FORD $101.79 $610.74 226-069020-000 Smith Blair F1-724-20 $94.15 $564.90 FORD $108.97 $653.82 romac
11-26-A--01-09 6"x7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp (3/4"Corp Tap) 6 each $59.19 $355.14 romac M502070655 $52.43 $314.58 6X7 1-1/2 FC REP CLMP W/ 3/4 CC TAP 6.55-6.97 O.D. RANGE Mueller/Powerseal $51.45 $308.70 FORD $53.09 $318.54 238-069007-007 Smith Blair F1-724-75CC3 $53.30 $319.80 FORD $57.18 $343.08 romac
11-26-A--01-10 6"x 12-1/2" Full Circle Clamp (3/4" Corp Tap) 6 each $84.30 $505.80 romac M502120655 $74.13 $444.78 6X12 FC REP CLMP W/ 3/4 CC TAP 6.55-6.97 O.D. RANGE Mueller $71.95 $431.70 FORD $75.75 $454.50 238-069012-007 Smith Blair F1-724-125CC3 $74.50 $447.00 FORD $81.44 $488.64 romac
11-26-A--01-11 6" x 15" Full Circle Clamp (3/4" Corp Tap) 2 each $87.45 $174.90 romac M502150655 $80.97 $161.94 6X15 FC REP CLMP W/ 3/4 CC TAP 6.55-6.97 O.D. RANGE Mueller $76.54 $153.08 FORD $85.55 $171.10 238-069015-007 Smith Blair F1-724-15-CC3 $80.50 $161.00 FORD $84.49 $168.98 romac
11-26-A--01-12 8"x7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp 20 each $49.17 $983.40 romac M500070899 $43.44 $868.80 8.99-9.39 O.D. RANGE Mueller $40.68 $813.60 FORD $45.22 $904.40 226-090507-000 Smith Blair F1-939-75 $41.40 $828.00 FORD $47.50 $950.00 romac
11-26-A--01-13 8"x12-1/2" Full Circle Clamp 20 each $78.75 $1,575.00 romac M500120899 $69.57 $1,391.40 8.99-9.39 Mueller $65.18 $1,303.60 FORD $72.40 $1,448.00 226-090512-000 Smith Blair F1-939-125 $66.50 $1,330.00 FORD $76.07 $1,521.40 romac
11-26-A--01-14 8"x 15" Full Circle Clamp 8 each $95.57 $764.56 romac M500150899 $80.36 $642.88 8.99-9.39 Mueller $73.76 $590.08 FORD $86.27 $690.16 226-090515-000 Smith Blair F1-939-15 $76.05 $608.40 FORD $92.33 $738.64 romac
11-26-A--01-15 8"x20" Full Circle Clamp 6 each $129.99 $779.94 romac M500200899 $138.06 $828.36 8.99-9.39 Mueller/Powerseal $105.05 $630.30 FORD $119.52 $717.12 226-090520-000 Smith Blair F1-939-20 $108.35 $650.10 FORD $125.57 $753.42 romac
11-26-A--01-16 8"x 7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp (3/4" Corp Tab) 6 each $66.48 $398.88 romac M502070899 $59.08 $354.48 8.99-9.39 Mueller $57.60 $345.60 FORD $60.51 $363.06 238-090507-007 Smith Blair F1-939-75-CC3 $59.40 $356.40 FORD $64.22 $385.32 romac
11-26-A--01-17 8"x 12-1/2" Full Circle Clamp (3/4" Corp Tab) 6 each $96.06 $576.36 romac M502070899 $84.67 $508.02 8.99-9.39 Mueller $81.85 $491.10 FORD $87.70 $526.20 238-090512-007 Smith Blair F1-939-125-CC3 $84.40 $506.40 FORD $92.80 $556.80 romac
11-26-A--01-18 8"x 15" Full Circle Clamp (3/4" Corp Tab) 2 each $112.88 $225.76 romac M502150899 $96.72 $193.44 8.99-9.39 Mueller $90.17 $180.34 FORD $101.57 $203.14 238-090515-007 Smith Blair F1-939-15-CC3 $93.95 $187.90 FORD $109.04 $218.08 romac
11-26-A--01-19 10"x10" Full Circle Clamp 6 each $87.36 $524.16 romac M500101104 $69.26 $415.56 11.04-11.46 O.D. RANGE Mueller $71.45 $428.70 FORD $74.34 $446.04 226-111010-000 Smith Blair F1-1144-10 $73.70 $442.20 FORD $84.38 $506.28 romac
11-26-A--01-20 10"x15" Full Circle Clamp 2 each $126.55 $253.10 romac M500151104 $100.34 $200.68 11.04-11.46 O.D. RANGE Mueller $94.24 $188.48 FORD $107.73 $215.46 226-111015-000 Smith Blair F1-1144-15 $98.20 $196.40 FORD $122.26 $244.52 romac
11-26-A--01-21 12"x12 1/2" Full Circle Clamp 8 each $116.94 $935.52 romac M500121314 $106.44 $851.52 13.14.013.56 O.D. RANGE Mueller $96.79 $774.32 FORD $99.90 $799.20 226-132012-000 Smith Blair F1-1350-125 $98.80 $790.40 FORD $112.97 $903.76 romac
11-26-A--01-22 12"x15" Full Circle Clamp 4 each $145.82 $583.28 romac M500151314 $115.61 $462.44 13.14-13.56 O.D. RANGE Mueller $108.29 $433.16 FORD $124.13 $496.52 226-132015-000 Smith Blair F1-1350-15 $111.70 $446.80 FORD $140.86 $563.44 romac
11-26-A--01-23 12"x20" Full Circle Clamp 2 each $192.59 $385.18 romac P312112C20 M500201314 $152.22 $304.44 13.10-13.50 O.D. RANGE Powerseal/Mueller $150.95 $301.90 FORD $163.95 $327.90 226-132020-000 Smith Blair F1-1350-20 $155.70 $311.40 FORD $186.04 $372.08 romac
11-26-A--01-24 12"x 10" Full Circle Clamp (3/4" Corp Tap) 2 each $114.29 $228.58 romac M502101314 $94.70 $189.40 Mueller $97.56 $195.12 FORD $97.85 $195.70 238-132010-007 Smith Blair F1-1350-10-CC3 $99.60 $199.20 FORD $110.40 $220.80 romac
11-26-A--01-25 12"x 15" Full Circle Clamp (3/4" Corp Tap) 1 each $163.13 $163.13 romac M502151314 $115.61 $115.61 Mueller $124.00 $124.00 FORD $139.43 $139.43 238-132015-007 Smith Blair F1-1350-15-CC3 $129.55 $129.55 FORD $157.59 $157.59 romac

Totals: $13,832.33 $12,065.25 $11,420.56 $12,261.13 $11,791.53 $13,365.73

Lot: Tapping Saddle Ford or Approved Equal:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS S Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--02-01 2" x 3/4" Brass Tapping Saddle 6 each $13.00 $78.00 mcdonald M3801KF $12.80 $76.80 AY McDonald $13.05 $78.30 FORD $15.04 $90.24 H13420 Mueller S70-203 $8.90 $53.40 FORD $15.42 $92.52 romac
11-26-A--02-02 4"x3/4" Brass Tapping Saddle 2 each $57.68 $115.36 mcdonald M3825PF $56.79 $113.58 AY McDonald $57.70 $115.40 FORD $62.75 $125.50 BR2B0474CC075 Mueller 202B540CC3 $59.50 $119.00 FORD $50.03 $100.06 romac
11-26-A--02-03 6" x 3/4" Brass Tapping Saddle 6 each $58.68 $352.08 romac M3825UF $66.89 $401.34 AY McDonald $68.67 $412.02 FORD $73.90 $443.40 BR2B0684CC075 Mueller 202B750CC3 $70.10 $420.60 FORD $59.62 $357.72 romac
11-26-A--02-04 6"x1" Brass Tapping Saddle 2 each $58.68 $117.36 romac M3825UG $66.89 $133.78 AY McDonald $68.67 $137.34 FORD $73.90 $147.80 BR2B0684CC100 Mueller 202B750CC4 $70.10 $140.20 FORD $59.62 $119.24 romac
11-26-A--02-05 6"x 2" Brass Tapping Saddle 2 each $85.34 $170.68 mcdonald M3825UK $83.16 $166.32 AY McDonald $85.38 $170.76 FORD $92.89 $185.78 BR2B0684CC200 Mueller 202B750CC7 $88.05 $176.10 FORD $105.84 $211.68 romac
11-26-A--02-06 8" x 3/4" Brass Tapping Saddle 4 each $61.59 $246.36 romac M3825XF $81.93 $327.72 AY McDonald $84.15 $336.60 FORD $91.49 $365.96 BR2B0899CC075 Mueller 202B962CC3 $86.75 $347.00 FORD $62.57 $250.28 romac
11-26-A--02-07 8"x 1" Brass Tapping Saddle 2 each $61.59 $123.18 romac M3825XG $81.93 $163.86 AY McDonald $84.15 $168.30 FORD $91.49 $182.98 BR2B0899CC100 Mueller 202B963CC4 $86.75 $173.50 FORD $62.57 $125.14 romac
11-26-A--02-08 8"x2" Brass Tapping Saddle 1 each $96.37 $96.37 mcdonald M3825XK $94.89 $94.89 AY McDonald $95.45 $95.45 FORD $104.96 $104.96 BR2B0899CC200 Mueller 202B963CC7 $99.45 $99.45 FORD $120.91 $120.91 romac
11-26-A--02-09 10" x 3/4" Brass Tapping Saddle 2 each $80.56 $161.12 romac M382510F $102.04 $204.08 AY McDonald $104.25 $208.50 FORD $113.34 $226.68 BR2B1104CC075 Mueller 202B1212CC3 $107.50 $215.00 FORD $81.85 $163.70 romac
11-26-A--02-10 10"x 1" Brass Tapping Saddle 1 each $80.56 $80.56 romac M382510G $101.52 $101.52 AY McDonald $104.25 $104.25 FORD $113.34 $113.34 BR2B1104CC100 Mueller 202B1212CC4 $107.50 $107.50 FORD $81.85 $81.85 romac
11-26-A--02-11 10"x 2" Brass Tapping Saddle 1 each $122.88 $122.88 mcdonald M382510K $120.98 $120.98 AY McDonald $121.65 $121.65 FORD $133.72 $133.72 BR2B1104CC200 Mueller 202B1212CC7 $126.75 $126.75 FORD $141.26 $141.26 romac
11-26-A--02-12 12"x 3/4" Brass Tapping Saddle 2 each $85.81 $171.62 romac M382512F $118.81 $237.62 AY McDonald $121.95 $243.90 FORD $132.67 $265.34 BR2B1314CC075 Mueller 202B1438CC3 $125.80 $251.60 FORD $87.18 $174.36 romac
11-26-A--02-13 12"x 1" Brass Tapping Saddle 1 each $85.81 $85.81 romac M382512G $118.81 $118.81 AY McDonald $121.95 $121.95 FORD $132.67 $132.67 BR2B1314CC100 Mueller 202B1438CC4 $125.80 $125.80 FORD $87.18 $87.18 romac

FERGUSON WATERWORKS MSC WATERWORKSMUNICIPAL WATER WORKS SUPPLY LP

FERGUSON WATERWORKS

pp g
11-26-A--02-14 12"x2" Brass Tapping Saddle 1 each $139.99 $139.99 mcdonald M382512K $136.42 $136.42 AY McDonald $140.00 $140.00 FORD $152.36 $152.36 BR2B1314CC200 Mueller 202B1438CC7 $144.45 $144.45 FORD $156.38 $156.38 romac

Totals: $2,061.37 $2,397.72 $2,454.42 $2,670.73 $2,500.35 $2,182.28

Lot: Corporations Ford or Approved Equal:
Morrison Supply Hughes Supply Inc. Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--03-01 3/4" Tapered Thread X Comp 100 each $17.17 $1,717.00 mcdonald M4701QF $16.90 $1,690.00 AY McDonald $17.20 $1,720.00 FORD $17.47 $1,747.00 H15008 Mueller F10003Q $17.70 $1,770.00 FORD $19.49 $1,949.00 ford
11-26-A--03-02 3/4" Tapered Pipe X Comp 50 each $17.17 $858.50 mcdonald M4704QF $16.90 $845.00 3/4 MNPT X CTS TUBE CORP AY McDonald $17.20 $860.00 FORD $17.47 $873.50 H15028 Mueller F11003Q $17.70 $885.00 FORD $19.48 $974.00 ford
11-26-A--03-03 1" Tapered Thread X Comp 25 each $25.98 $649.50 mcdonald M4701QG $25.57 $639.25 AY McDonald $25.99 $649.75 FORD $26.46 $661.50 H15008 Mueller F10004Q $26.80 $670.00 FORD $30.04 $751.00 ford
11-26-A--03-04 1" Tapered Pipe X Comp 20 each $25.98 $519.60 mcdonald M4704QG $25.45 $509.00 1 MIP X CTS CORP STOP AY McDonald $25.99 $519.80 FORD $26.46 $529.20 H15028 Mueller F11004Q $26.80 $536.00 FORD $30.04 $600.80 ford
11-26-A--03-05 1-1/2" Tapered Thread X Comp 2 each $66.85 $133.70 mcdonald M4701BQJ $65.49 $130.98 AY McDonald $66.87 $133.74 FORD $68.09 $136.18 B25008 Mueller FB10006Q $68.95 $137.90 FORD $77.31 $154.62 ford
11-26-A--03-06 1-1/2" Tapered Pipe X Comp 2 each $66.85 $133.70 mcdonald M4704BQJ $65.49 $130.98 AY McDonald $66.87 $133.74 FORD $68.09 $136.18 B25028 Mueller FB11006Q $68.95 $137.90 FORD $77.31 $154.62 ford
11-26-A--03-07 2" Tapered Thread X Comp 10 each $110.59 $1,105.90 mcdonald M4701BQK $108.88 $1,088.80 AY McDonald $110.65 $1,106.50 FORD $112.60 $1,126.00 B25008 Mueller FB10007Q $114.05 $1,140.50 FORD $127.87 $1,278.70 ford
11-26-A--03-08 2" Tapered Pipe X Comp 10 each $110.59 $1,105.90 mcdonald M4704BQK $108.88 $1,088.80 2 MIP X CTS COMP CORP AY McDonald $110.65 $1,106.50 FORD $112.60 $1,126.00 B25028 Mueller FB11007Q $114.05 $1,140.50 FORD $127.87 $1,278.70 ford

Totals: $6,223.80 $6,122.81 $6,230.03 $6,335.56 $6,417.80 $7,141.44

Lot: Service Fittings Mueller or Approved Equal:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS S Hughes Supply Inc. Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--04-01 Coupling Service Fitting 100 each $9.36 $936.00 mcdonald M4758QF $9.31 $931.00 3/4 CTS COMP UNION AY McDonald $9.50 $950.00 FORD $9.76 $976.00 H15403 Mueller C44-33Q $9.65 $965.00 FORD $10.83 $1,082.70 ford
11-26-A--04-02 Coupling Service Fitting 20 each $10.71 $214.20 mcdonald M4758QG $10.54 $210.80 AY McDonald $10.85 $217.00 FORD $10.65 $213.00 H15403 Mueller C44-44Q $11.05 $221.00 FORD $12.39 $247.70 ford
11-26-A--04-03 Coupling Service Fitting 5 each $32.76 $163.80 mcdonald M4758QJ $31.93 $159.65 1-1/2 COMP X COMP UNION AY McDonald $32.77 $163.85 FORD $34.09 $170.45 H15403 Mueller C44-66Q $33.80 $169.00 FORD $37.89 $189.45 ford
11-26-A--04-04 Coupling Service Fitting 5 each $44.24 $221.20 mcdonald M4758QK $43.56 $217.80 AY McDonald $44.25 $221.25 FORD $46.03 $230.15 H15403 Mueller C44-77Q $45.60 $228.00 FORD $51.15 $255.75 ford
11-26-A--04-05 Straight Coupling 30 each $7.68 $230.40 mcdonald M4753QF $7.49 $224.70 AY McDonald $7.73 $231.90 FORD $8.00 $240.00 H15428 Mueller C84-33Q $7.90 $237.00 FORD $8.90 $267.00 ford
11-26-A--04-06 Straight Coupling 20 each $8.08 $161.60 mcdonald M4754QF $7.96 $159.20 3/4 CTS COMP X FNPT AY McDonald $8.17 $163.40 FORD $8.57 $171.40 H15451 Mueller C14-33Q $8.30 $166.00 FORD $9.35 $187.00 ford
11-26-A--04-07 Service TEE 5 each $22.67 $113.35 mcdonald M4760QF $22.09 $110.45 AY McDonald $22.69 $113.45 FORD $22.45 $112.25 H15381 Mueller T444-33Q $23.35 $116.75 FORD $26.20 $131.00 ford
11-26-A--04-08 Quarter Bend Union 50 each $12.09 $604.50 mcdonald M4761QF $11.90 $595.00 3/4 CTS X CTS 90 BEND AY McDonald $12.25 $612.50 FORD $12.00 $600.00 H15526 Mueller L44-33Q $12.45 $622.50 FORD $14.00 $700.00 ford
11-26-A--04-09 Quarter Bend Union 10 each $12.09 $120.90 mcdonald M4761QF $11.90 $119.00 3/4 CTS X CTS 90 BEND (DUPLICATE ITEM?) AY McDonald $15.56 $155.60 FORD $15.41 $154.10 H15526 Mueller L44-33Q $12.45 $124.50 FORD $14.00 $140.00 ford
11-26-A--04-10 1" Coupling Copper Comp By Female Iron Pipe 25 each $10.96 $274.00 mcdonald M4754QG $10.78 $269.50 AY McDonald $10.99 $274.75 FORD $12.26 $306.50 H15451 Mueller C14-44Q $11.30 $282.50 FORD $12.70 $317.50 ford
11-26-A--04-11 1" Coupling Copper Comp By Male Iron Pipe 25 each $9.11 $227.75 mcdonald M4753QG $8.95 $223.75 AY McDonald $9.15 $228.75 FORD $9.44 $236.00 H15428 Mueller C84-44Q $9.40 $235.00 FORD $10.53 $263.25 ford
11-26-A--04-12 1-1/2" Coupling 90 Degree Comp by Comp 2 each $45.64 $91.28 mcdonald M4761QJ $44.47 $88.94 AY McDonald $45.65 $91.30 FORD $47.49 $94.98 H15526 Mueller L44-66Q $47.05 $94.10 FORD $52.77 $105.54 ford
11-26-A--04-13 2" Coupling 90 Degree Comp by Comp 10 each $92.33 $923.30 mcdonald M4761QK $90.91 $909.10 AY McDonald $93.25 $932.50 FORD $96.08 $960.80 H15526 Mueller L44-77Q $95.25 $952.50 FORD $106.77 $1,067.70 ford
11-26-A--04-14 Service TEE 10 each $24.24 $242.40 mcdonald M4760QG $23.62 $236.20 1 COMP TEE AY McDonald $24.25 $242.50 FORD $31.11 $311.10 H15381 Mueller T444-444Q $25.00 $250.00 FORD $28.04 $280.40 ford
11-26-A--04-15 Service TEE 10 each $24.14 $241.40 mcdonald M4760QFG $23.53 $235.30 3/4 X1 CTS COMP TEE AY McDonald $24.15 $241.50 FORD $23.93 $239.30 H15381 Mueller T444-334Q $24.90 $249.00 FORD $27.92 $279.20 ford
11-26-A--04-16 Service TEE 10 each $24.89 $248.90 mcdonald M4760QGF $24.26 $242.60 1X3/4 COMP TUBE TEE AY McDonald $24.95 $249.50 FORD $26.69 $266.90 H15381 Mueller T444-443AWTQ $37.60 $376.00 FORD $42.71 $427.10 ford
11-26-A--04-17 Angle Stop 90 Degree 3/4" Comp x Meter Swiv 150 each $20.40 $3,060.00 mcdonald M4602QF $20.09 $3,013.50 AY McDonald $20.65 $3,097.50 FORD $20.77 $3,115.50 H14258 Mueller KV43-332WQ $21.05 $3,157.50 FORD $23.60 $3,540.00 ford
11-26-A--04-18 Angle Ball Valve 90 Degree 3/4" Curb Stop Co 150 each $25.71 $3,856.50 mcdonald M4642BQF $25.06 $3,759.00 AY McDonald $23.00 $3,450.00 FORD $24.02 $3,603.00 B24258R Mueller B43-232WQ $23.50 $3,525.00 FORD $26.34 $3,950.70 ford
11-26-A--04-19 Angle Ball Valve 90 Degree 1" Curb Stop Com 50 each $46.30 $2,315.00 mcdonald M4642BQG $45.13 $2,256.50 AY McDonald $58.50 $2,925.00 FORD $47.50 $2,375.00 B24258R Mueller BA43-444WQ $60.25 $3,012.50 FORD $67.54 $3,377.00 ford
11-26-A--04-20 Straight Meter Valve 1" Straight Comp x Meter 15 each $42.52 $637.80 mcdonald M6100MWQG $41.87 $628.05 AY McDonald $52.30 $784.50 FORD $44.79 $671.85 B24350R Mueller B43-344WQ $43.85 $657.75 FORD $49.18 $737.70 ford
11-26-A--04-21 Angle Ball Valve 1-1/2" 90 Degree Flanged x C 5 each $123.20 $616.00 mcdonald M4602BQJ $120.07 $600.35 AY McDonald $123.25 $616.25 FORD $116.48 $582.40 B24276 Mueller BFA43-666WQ $127.05 $635.25 FORD $142.45 $712.25 ford
11-26-A--04-22 Straight Meter Valve 1-1/2" Straight Flanged x 2 each $85.45 $170.90 mcdonald M6100MWQJ $83.28 $166.56 AY McDonald $84.60 $169.20 FORD $90.01 $180.02 B24335 Mueller BF43-666WQ $88.15 $176.30 FORD $180.83 $361.66 ford
11-26-A--04-23 Angle Ball Valve 2" 90 Degree Flanged x Comp 10 each $156.37 $1,563.70 mcdonald M4602BQK $153.96 $1,539.60 AY McDonald $156.40 $1,564.00 FORD $148.47 $1,484.70 B24276 Mueller BFA43-777WQ $161.30 $1,613.00 FORD $167.42 $1,674.20 ford
11-26-A--04-24 Straight Meter Valve 2" Straight Flanged x Com 5 each $144.77 $723.85 mcdonald M6100MWQK $141.09 $705.45 AY McDonald $145.00 $725.00 FORD $152.48 $762.40 B24335 Mueller BF43-777WQ $149.35 $746.75 FORD $172.00 $860.00 ford
11-26-A--04-25 3/4" Meter Riser 12" 25 each $51.67 $1,291.75 mcdonald M18212WX $50.88 $1,272.00 AY McDonald $68.19 $1,704.75 FORD $55.86 $1,396.50 H14118 Mueller V42-12W $49.75 $1,243.75 FORD $165.00 $4,125.00 ford
11-26-A--04-26 3/4" Meter Riser 6" 25 each $49.46 $1,236.50 mcdonald M18207WX $48.71 $1,217.75 AY McDonald $59.75 $1,493.75 FORD $51.57 $1,289.25 H14118 Mueller V42-7W $47.50 $1,187.50 FORD $125.00 $3,125.00 ford

Totals: $20,486.98 $20,091.75 $21,619.70 $20,743.55 $21,244.15 $28,404.80
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Lot: Flange Kits:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS SUPPLY LP Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.

11-26-A--05-01 1-1/2" Meter Flange Kit with 5/8" x 2-1/2" Bolt 10 each $24.65 $246.50 buy wholesale MFKJ $25.50 $255.00 EGW $34.15 $341.50 FORD/IMC $41.25 $412.50

CONTAINS 2 
BRASS OVAL 
METER FLANGES 
2- 1/8" THICK 
NEOPRENE DROP 
IN STYLE GENERIC 1915 $47.80 $478.00 MIDLAND $42.00 $420.00 egw

11-26-A--05-02 2" Meter Flange Kit with 5/8" x 2-1/2" Bolt 10 each $28.44 $284.40 buy wholesale MFKK $27.66 $276.60 EGW $42.45 $424.50 FORD/IMC $45.00 $450.00

EACH KIT 
CONTAINS 2 
BRASS OVAL 
METER FLANGES 
2- 1/8" THICK GENERIC 1925 $48.50 $485.00 MIDLAND $48.00 $480.00 egw

11-26-A--05-03 1-1/2" Meter Flange Gasket 200 each $0.63 $126.00 buy wholesale JJ129GJ $0.40 $80.00 EGW $0.98 $196.00 EGW $0.70 $140.00 1/8" THICK NEOPREGENERIC $1.75 $350.00 EGW $0.87 $174.00 egw
11-26-A--05-04 2" Meter Flange Gasket 200 each $0.72 $144.00 buy wholesale JJ129GK $0.44 $88.00 EGW $1.01 $202.00 EGW $0.80 $160.00 1/8" THICK NEOPREGENERIC $2.00 $400.00 EGW $0.93 $186.00 egw

Totals: $800.90 $699.60 $1,164.00 $1,162.50 $1,713.00 $1,260.00

Lot: Meter Nipples:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS S Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--06-01 3/4" x 2" Length 350 each $4.99 $1,746.50 mcdonald MH10890F $5.04 $1,764.00 Mueller/AY McDonald $5.07 $1,774.50 FORD $6.50 $2,275.00  H10890-99012SPEC Mueller C38232 $5.15 $1,802.50 FORD $8.00 $2,800.00 ford
11-26-A--06-02 1" x 2" Length 200 each $8.84 $1,768.00 mcdonald MH10890G $7.75 $1,550.00 Muller/AY McDonald $7.56 $1,512.00 FORD $17.53 $3,506.00  H10890-99012SPEC MUELLER C38442 $7.70 $1,540.00 FORD $10.00 $2,000.00 ford

Totals: $3,514.50 $3,314.00 $3,286.50 $5,781.00 $3,342.50 $4,800.00

Lot: Meter Washers:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS SUPPLY LP Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--07-01 1" x 1/8" - Rubber 1000 each $0.087 $86.70 buy wholesale MRGG18 $0.09 $90.00 EGW $0.11 $110.00 EGW $0.11 $110.00 1/8" THICK RUBBERGENERIC $0.15 $150.00 EGW $0.18 $180.00 egw
11-26-A--07-02 3/4" x 1/8" - Rubber 1000 each $0.063 $62.50 buy wholesale MRGF18 $0.08 $80.00 EGW $0.10 $100.00 EGW $0.08 $80.00 1/8" THICK RUBBERGENERIC $0.08 $80.00 EGW $0.16 $160.00 egw
11-26-A--07-03 3/4" x 1/16" - Fiber 500 each $0.067 $33.35 buy wholesale MFGF116 $0.08 $40.00 EGW $0.10 $50.00 EGW $0.08 $40.00 1/16" THICK FIBER GENERIC $0.12 $60.00 EGW $0.14 $70.00 egw

Totals: $182.55 $210.00 $260.00 $230.00 $290.00 $410.00

Lot: Repair Kits:
Morrison Supply Hughes Supply Inc. Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--08-01 Mueller Fire Hydrant Repair Kit 5-1/4" M.V.O. 20 each $105.00 $2,100.00 hrpi MA301 $101.00 $2,020.00 This is a 5-1/4 Safety Flange Repair Kit. Mueller/Hydrant Repair P $103.00 $2,060.00 HRPI-301 $115.00 $2,300.00 A301 HRP HROI301 $113.00 $2,260.00 HYDRANT REPAIR $107.00 $2,140.00 hydrant repair
11-26-A--08-02 Watrous Repair Kit 20 each $92.50 $1,850.00 hrpi WK528 $88.00 $1,760.00 Waterous $92.00 $1,840.00 HRPI-5-W528 $105.00 $2,100.00 WK528 HRP HRPI5W528 $99.00 $1,980.00 HYDRANT REPAIR $93.17 $1,863.40 hydrant repair

Totals: $3,950.00 $3,780.00 $3,900.00 $4,400.00 $4,240.00 $4,003.40

Lot: Copper:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS SUPPLY LP Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--09-01 3/4" X 100' Type K Soft Copper 20 roll $0.00 $0.00 no bid KSOFTF100 $415.00 $8,300.00 Cerro/Mueller $463.00 $9,260.00 WIELAND $475.00 $9,500.00 GENERIC $520.00 $10,400.00 HOWELL $472.00 $9,440.00 howell
11-26-A--09-02 1" X 100' Type K Soft Copper 10 roll $0.00 $0.00 no bid KSOFTG100 $540.00 $5,400.00 Cerro/Mueller $610.00 $6,100.00 WIELAND $600.00 $6,000.00 GENERIC $677.00 $6,770.00 HOWELL $614.00 $6,140.00 howell
11-26-A--09-03 1-1/2" x 60' Type K Soft Copper 1 roll $0.00 $0.00 no bid KSOFTJ60 $540.00 $540.00 Cerro/Mueller $707.40 $707.40 WIELAND $570.00 $570.00 GENERIC $678.00 $678.00 HOWELL $615.00 $615.00 howell
11-26-A--09-04 2" x 40' Type K Soft Copper 1 roll $0.00 $0.00 no bid KSOFTK40 $580.80 $580.80 Cerro/Mueller $759.60 $759.60 WIELAND $620.00 $620.00 GENERIC $728.00 $728.00 HOWELL $16.52 $16.52 howell
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yp pp
11-26-A--09-05 3/4" X 60' Type K Soft Copper 5 roll $0.00 $0.00 no bid KSOFTF60 $249.00 $1,245.00 Cerro/Mueller $273.60 $1,368.00 WIELAND $285.00 $1,425.00 GENERIC $312.00 $1,560.00 HOWELL $283.20 $1,416.00 howell
11-26-A--09-06 1" X 60' Type K Soft Copper 5 roll $0.00 $0.00 no bid KSOFTG60 $324.00 $1,620.00 Cerro/Mueller $352.20 $1,761.00 WIELAND $360.00 $1,800.00 GENERIC $406.20 $2,031.00 HOWELL $368.00 $1,840.00 howell
11-26-A--09-07 2" X 20' Type K Hard Copper 5 each $0.00 $0.00 no bid KHARDK20 $310.37 $1,551.85 Cerro/Mueller $364.20 $1,821.00 WIELAND $310.00 $1,550.00 GENERIC $364.00 $1,820.00 HOWELL $290.60 $1,453.00 cerro

Totals: $0.00 $19,237.65 $21,777.00 $21,465.00 $23,987.00 $20,920.52

Lot: CT Adapters:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS S Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--10-01 4x4 Clay to PVC 20 each $2.84 $56.80 fernco F100244 $3.20 $64.00 Fernco $3.16 $63.20 FERNCO $3.30 $66.00 1002-44 FERNCO $2.85 $57.00 FERNCO $2.60 $52.00 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-02 4x4 PVC to PVC 40 each $2.84 $113.60 fernco F105644 $3.20 $128.00 Fernco $3.16 $126.40 FERNCO $3.30 $132.00 1056-44 FERNCO $2.85 $114.00 FERNCO $2.60 $104.00 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-03 4x6 Clay to PVC 6 each $7.30 $43.80 fernco F100246 $7.20 $43.20 Fernco $8.12 $48.72 FERNCO $8.30 $49.80 1002-46 FERNCO $7.33 $43.98 FERNCO $6.05 $36.30 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-04 4x6 PVC to PVC 6 each $7.13 $42.78 fernco F105644 $7.18 $43.08 Fernco $7.95 $47.70 FERNCO $8.30 $49.80 1056-64 FERNCO $7.33 $43.98 FERNCO $6.05 $36.30 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-05 6x4 Clay to PVC 10 each $7.13 $71.30 fernco F100264 $7.02 $70.20 Fernco $7.95 $79.50 FERNCO $8.30 $83.00 1002-64 FERNCO $7.33 $73.30 FERNCO $6.05 $60.50 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-06 6x4 PVC to PVC 10 each $7.13 $71.30 fernco F105664 $7.18 $71.80 Fernco $7.95 $79.50 FERNCO $8.30 $83.00 1056-64 FERNCO $7.33 $73.30 FERNCO $6.05 $60.50 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-07 6x6 Clay to PVC 10 each $6.07 $60.70 fernco F100266 $6.25 $62.50 Fernco $6.75 $67.50 FERNCO $7.07 $70.70 1002-66 FERNCO $6.10 $61.00 FERNCO $5.58 $55.80 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-08 6x6 PVC to PVC 10 each $6.07 $60.70 fernco F105666 $6.25 $62.50 Fernco $6.75 $67.50 FERNCO $7.07 $70.70 1056-66 FERNCO $6.10 $61.00 FERNCO $5.58 $55.80 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-09 8x8 Clay to PVC 10 each $9.35 $93.50 fernco F100288 $9.40 $94.00 Fernco $10.40 $104.00 FERNCO $10.89 $108.90 1002-88 FERNCO $9.40 $94.00 FERNCO $8.54 $85.40 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-10 8x8 PVC to PVC 10 each $9.35 $93.50 fernco F105688 $9.40 $94.00 Fernco $10.40 $104.00 FERNCO $10.89 $108.90 1056-88 FERNCO $9.40 $94.00 FERNCO $8.54 $85.40 pipeconx

11-26-A--10-11 4" PVC Threaded Clean Out Cap 100 each $4.07 $407.00 plastic trends PSSFAP/PSSTPP $4.01 $401.00
4 PVC SWR HUB FEM CO ADPT and 4 PVC SWR RH THRD 
CO PLUG Multi-Fittings $1.75 $175.00 PLASTIC TRENDS $1.61 $161.00 P1154 PLASTIC TRENDS $4.35 $435.00 GPK $2.00 $200.00 plastictrends

11-26-A--10-12 4" PVC Rubber Cap 20 each $1.82 $36.40 fernco PFETCP $1.63 $32.60 Fernco $2.75 $55.00 FERNCO $3.00 $60.00 QC-104 FERNCO $2.10 $42.00 FERNCO $1.20 $24.00 pipeconx
11-26-A--10-13 4" PVC SDR 35 2-way Clean Out 20 each $7.26 $145.20 plastic trends PSS2WCOP $7.07 $141.40 Multi-Fittings $8.35 $167.00 PT $7.63 $152.60 P1004 PLASTIC TRENDS $7.30 $146.00 GPK $18.00 $360.00 plastic trends
11-26-A--10-14 4" PVC SDR 40 2-way Clean Out 20 each $17.15 $343.00 plastic trends PDWVCOTP $15.65 $313.00 Multi-Fittings $19.50 $390.00 PT $14.81 $296.20 D448-040 LASCO $17.75 $355.00 GPK $15.00 $300.00 plastic trends
11-26-A--10-15 4" PVC Bushing Sch 40 to SDR-35 50 each $5.42 $271.00 plastic trends PSSDHAP $5.40 $270.00 Multi-Fittings $6.75 $337.50 PT $2.56 $128.00 P1208 PLASTIC TRENDS $5.00 $250.00 GPK $4.85 $242.50 plastic trends

Totals: $1,910.58 $1,891.28 $1,912.52 $1,620.60 $1,943.56 $1,758.50

FERGUSON WATERWORKS



Lot: Cast Iron Sleeve:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS SUPPLY LP Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--11-01 2x6 Str. Coupling (Blue Boy) 20 each $31.71 $634.20 romac S41100023801003 $35.00 $700.00 Smith Blair / Romac $18.95 $379.00 SB/FORD $18.09 $361.80 411-023801-003 SMITH BLAIR FC1263263 $20.20 $404.00 FORD $48.00 $960.00 romac
11-26-A--11-02 4 x 12 Cast Iron Sleeve w. Exc 6 each $109.23 $655.38 tyler MJLSLAP $32.87 $197.22 Tyler $82.10 $492.60 TYLER $90.00 $540.00 DOMESTIC TYLER $83.00 $498.00 TYLER $43.12 $258.72 tyler
11-26-A--11-03 6 x 12 Cast Iron Sleeve w/Exc 6 each $156.15 $936.90 tyler MJLSLAU $57.41 $344.46 Tyler $114.10 $684.60 TYLER $125.00 $750.00 DOMESTIC TYLER $116.00 $696.00 TYLER $68.31 $409.86 tyler
11-26-A--11-04 8x12 Cast Iron Sleeve w/Exc 6 each $195.69 $1,174.14 tyler MJLSLAX $89.38 $536.28 Tyler $142.61 $855.66 TYLER $155.00 $930.00 DOMESTIC TYLER $145.00 $870.00 TYLER $100.234 $601.404 tyler
11-26-A--11-05 10x12 Cast Iron Sleeve w/Exc 2 each $282.14 $564.28 tyler MJLSLA10 $108.05 $216.10 Tyler $154.70 $309.40 TYLER $225.00 $450.00 DOMESTIC TYLER $214.00 $428.00 TYLER $122.82 $245.64 tyler
11-26-A--11-06 12x12 Cast Iron Sleeve w/Exc 6 each $358.53 $2,151.18 tyler MJLSLA12 $142.81 $856.86 Tyler $265.05 $1,590.30 TYLER $285.00 $1,710.00 DOMESTIC TYLER $270.00 $1,620.00 TYLER $157.34 $944.04 tyler

Totals: $6,116.08 $2,850.92 $4,311.56 $4,741.80 $4,516.00 $3,419.66

Lot: Mega Lugs:
Morrison Supply Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--12-01 6" Mega Lugs Including Kits 12 each $29.69 $356.28 romac E2006PV $33.90 $406.80 EBAA $31.30 $375.60 SMITH BLAIR $39.00 $468.00  DOMESTICSTAR IS EBBA OR STAR $35.25 $423.00 FORD $29.84 $358.08 romac
11-26-A--12-02 8" Mega Lugs Including Kits 12 each $40.35 $484.20 romac E2008PV $46.67 $560.04 EBAA $43.10 $517.20 SB $52.50 $630.00  DOMESTICSTAR IS EBBA OR STAR $48.25 $579.00 FORD $40.57 $486.84 romac
11-26-A--12-03 10" Mega Lugs 4 each $57.17 $228.68 romac E2010PV $84.00 $336.00 EBAA $75.63 $302.52 SB $111.00 $444.00  DOMESTICSTAR IS EBBA OR STAR $57.95 $231.80 FORD $57.47 $229.88 romac
11-26-A--12-04 12" Mega Lugs 12 each $76.96 $923.52 romac E2012PV $88.82 $1,065.84 EBAA $79.75 $957.00 SB $95.00 $1,140.00  DOMESTICSTAR IS EBBA OR STAR $61.00 $732.00 FORD $77.37 $928.44 romac

Totals: $1,992.68 $2,368.68 $2,152.32 $2,682.00 $1,965.80 $2,003.24

Lot: Sewer Tapp:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS SUPPLY LP Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--13-01 4" Sewer Tapp Fits 4"-12" 10 each $27.66 $276.60 romac FTST4 $26.96 $269.60 Fernco $31.45 $314.50 FERNCO $24.50 $245.00 RUBBER SADDLE T FERNCO $30.50 $305.00 FERNCO $25.00 $250.00 pipe conx

Lot: Pipe:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS SUPPLY LP Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.

11-26-A--14-01 6" C900 Water Pipe Class 150PVC 100 foot $0.00 $0.00 no bid DR18BPU $3.86 $386.00 Diamond $5.99 $599.00 NAPCO/DIAMOND $6.68 $668.00

DR18 CL150
IMPORTANT! 
PRICING DOES GENERIC $4.76 $476.00 DIAMAND $6.38 $638.00 jm eagle

11-26-A--14-02 8" C900 Water Pipe Class 150 PVC 100 foot $0.00 $0.00 no bid DR18BPX $6.70 $670.00 Diamond $9.22 $922.00 NAPCO/DIAMOND $11.51 $1,151.00

IMPORTANT! 
PRICING DOES 
NOT GUARANTEE   GENERIC $8.24 $824.00 DIAMAND $11.07 $1,107.00 jm eagle

11-26-A--14-03 4" Sewer SDR 35 Pipe 100 foot $0.00 $0.00 no bid SDR35PP14 $0.81 $81.00 Diamond $0.94 $94.00 NAPCO/DIAMOND $1.33 $133.00

SDR35
IMPORTANT! 
PRICING DOES GENERIC $0.98 $98.00 DIAMAND $1.20 $120.00 jm eagle

Totals: $0.00 $1,137.00 $1,615.00 $1,952.00 $1,398.00 $1,865.00

Lot: Miscellaneous Items:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS SUPPLY LP Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
A423
NST
OPEN LEFT
BLACK PRIMER 
OR RED 
DEPENDING ON
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11-26-A--15-01 Mueller Fire Hydrant 5' Bury 2 each $0.00 $0.00 no bid MA423LAOLS $1,519.75 $3,039.50 Mueller $2,000.00 $4,000.00 AVK $1,555.00 $3,110.00

DEPENDING ON 
WHAT IS IN 
STOCK. MUELLER 129 $1,585.00 $3,170.00 M & H $1,875.00 $3,750.00 mueller

11-26-A--15-02 3/4" Mueller SS Insert for Polybutelyne Ford or 25 each $1.06 $26.50 mcdonald M504281 $1.33 $33.25 Mueller $1.13 $28.25 FORD $1.58 $39.50 504281 MUELLER INSERT51 $1.00 $25.00 FORD $1.20 $30.00 ford
11-26-A--15-03 1" Mueller SS Insert for Polybutelyne Ford or A 1 each $1.12 $1.12 mcdonald M504385 $1.42 $1.42 Mueller $1.19 $1.19 FORD $1.69 $1.69 504385 MUELLER INSERT52 $1.05 $1.05 FORD $1.26 $1.26 ford

Totals: $27.62 $3,074.17 $4,029.44 $3,151.19 $3,196.05 $3,781.26

Lot: Meter Boxes:
Morrison Supply MUNICIPAL WATER WORKS SUPPLY LP Hughes Supply Inc. MSC WATERWORKS Metro Valve  Pipe

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total MFG. Prod Code Price Total Notes MFG. Price Total MFG. Price Total Notes MFG. Prod Code Price Total MFG. Price Total MFG.
11-26-A--16-01 1" Residential Meter Box p/n DFW37CSBSM o 250 each $73.00 $18,250.00 dfw DDFW37C121A $61.00 $15,250.00 DFW Plastics $85.08 $21,270.00 DFW $67.05 $16,762.50  37C-SBSMCOMPLETDFW $72.50 $18,125.00 DFW $85.00 $21,250.00 dfw
11-26-A--16-02 2" Commercial Meter Box p/n DFW65CSBSM o 75 each $150.00 $11,250.00 dfw DDFW65C141BA $152.48 $11,436.00 DFW Plastics $164.75 $12,356.25 DFW $155.79 $11,684.25  65C-SBSMCOMPLETDFW $168.60 $12,645.00 DFW $160.00 $12,000.00 dfw
11-26-A--16-03 3/4" Meter Box Lid p/n DFW36CSBSM 150 each $29.69 $4,453.50 dfw DDFW36C121A $49.30 $7,395.00 DFW Plastics $26.55 $3,982.50 DFW $54.22 $8,133.00  36C-SBSMCOMPLETDFW $58.70 $8,805.00 DFW $68.01 $10,201.50 dfw
11-26-A--16-04 1" Meter Box Lid p/n DFW37CBSM 150 each $39.58 $5,937.00 dfw DDFW37C1ALID $29.89 $4,483.50 DFW Plastics $35.40 $5,310.00 DFW $28.53 $4,279.50 37C-SBSM-LID ONL DFW $30.90 $4,635.00 DFW $85.00 $12,750.00 dfw

Totals: $39,890.50 $38,564.50 $42,918.75 $40,859.25 $44,210.00 $56,201.50

Grand Total: $101,266.49 $118,074.93 $129,366.30 $130,301.31 $133,060.74 $151,767.33
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