BID NUMBER: 001-14

"ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS"

CITY OF EULESS - BID TABULATION

DATE :11/11/2013 TIME: 10:00 A.M.

BWI Winfield Agrium John Deere Ameriturf
Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's
Est. Qty Packaging Bid Price | Bidder's Product Bid Price | Bidder's Product Bid Price Product Bid Price Product Bid Price Product
FUNGICIDES
1|Eagle 20ew 10 gal. 1 gal. $ 177.23 As Specified $ 185.69 As Specified $ 207.76 | As Specified | $ 217.76 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
2|Daconil Zn 15 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 180.00 As Specified $ 180.00 As Specified $ 72.00 | As Specified | $ 180.00 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
3|Heritage TL 6 gal. 1 gal. $  509.00 As Specified $  509.00 As Specified $ 509.00 | As Specified | $ 509.00 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
HERBICIDES
1|Sedge Hammer 30 bottles 1.3 0z. bottles | $ 60.49 Prosedge $ 88.69 Prosedge 2 $ 84.92 Prosedge 2 $ 79.57 | Sledghammer | $ 88.00 Proedge
2|Primo Link Pak 20 gal. 10 gal. $ 2,740.00 As Specified $ 2,740.00 As Specified $ 274.00 | As Specified | $ 2,740.00 | As Specified | $ 1,850.00 T-Nex
3] Revolver 30 gts. 87 oz. $ 197.98 As Specified $ 196.74 As Specified $ 540.00 87 oz bl $ 273.92 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
4]Barricade 4L 50 gal. 1 gal. $ 142.00 Evade 4L $ 137.00 As Specified $ 137.00 | As Specified | $ 142.00 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
1500 grams |25 gram box $ 218.00 As Specified $ 215.00 As Specified $ 215.00 | As Specified | $ 240.00 | As Specified | $ 336.75 | As Specified
5/6]Monument Roundup Pro 90 gal. 30 gal. drum $ 531.66 Ranger Pro $ 715.20 As Specified $ 22.60 | per gal Kleenup | $ 554.68 | Presecutor | $ 18.75 | As Specified
7|Dimension 2ew 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $  499.38 As Specified $ 52575 As Specified $ 210.98 | As Specified | $ 616.31 | As Specified | $ 515.63 | As Specified
8|Surflan AS 50 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 103.38 As Specified $ 118.15 As Specified $ 49.66 | As Specified | $ 131.96 | As Specified | $ 160.00 | As Specified
9]Pendimethalin (Liquid Form) 100 gal. 2.5 gal. $ 62.38 Pin-Dec $ 93.70 As Specified $ 31.87 | As Specified | $ 81.32 | As Specified | $ 95.00 | As Specified
10]Specticle Flo 15 gal 1 gal. $ 1,470.00 As Specified $ 1,470.00 As Specified $ 1,470.00 | As Specified | $ 1,470.00 | As Specified | $ 1,470.00 | As Specified
INSECTICIDES
1}Provant 20 100z. Btls |10 oz. bottle $ 65.10 As Specified $ 67.40 As Specified No Bid No Bid $ 85.60 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
2]Battle GC/Scimitar GC 8 quarts Qt. $ 123.83 As Specified $ 126.20 As Specified No Bid No Bid $ 164.35 Scimitor $ 225.00 | Lamble Select
3]Advion Fire Ant 36# 12# bag $ 118.72 As Specified $ 290.69 25# bag No Bid No Bid $ 356.00 25# bag No Bid No Bid
4]Award Fire Ant 50# 25# bag $ 227.39 As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 383.10 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
OTHER
1|K-Mag 10 ton 50lb. $ 13.93 As Specified $ 16.50 As Specified No Bid No Bid $ 23.13 | As Specified No Bid No Bid
2] TriCure soil surfactant 165 gal. 55 gal $ 2,813.25 Aqueduct $ 3,737.80 As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12-0-0 w/6%--100% Chealated
3JIrn.+2% Mn 500 gal. 2.5 0r 30 gal $274.98 gal As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 410.83 |55 gal seebid| $ 5.90 | 270 gal tote




